
 City of Saint John Tender Summary  
 

2022-086401T - Equipment Rental 
 

Tender Opening: 2:30 P.M., Tuesday, August 30, 2022 
1st  Floor Boardroom, 175 Rothesay Avenue    

  
Compliance with Section 115 of New Brunswick Regulation 2014-93 under the Procurement Act 

 

Item Description Martin’s Crane 
Rental Ltd. 

Classic 
Construction 
(2012) Ltd. 

Ready Rentals 
Limited 

Larry’s 
Crane 

Rental Ltd. 

Maguire 
Excavating 

Ltd. 

D. Hatfield 
Inc. 

Fundy 
Fencing Ltd. 

Galbraith 
Construction 

Ltd. 

Section 1: Crawler Tractor with Blade (Dozer) 

 1a) 75 h.p. cat d-4 or equivalent No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 113.00 

   b) Float charge for above  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 150.00 

2 a) 90 h.p. cat d-6 or equivalent 
 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 185.00 

   b) Float charge for above  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 175.00 

3 a) Cat D-8 or equivalent No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 245.00 

   b) Float charge for above No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 175.00 
 



 
 

 
Item 

 
Description 

Martin’s 
Crane 

Rental Ltd. 

Classic 
Construction 
(2012) Ltd. 

Ready 
Rentals 
Limited 

Larry’s 
Crane 

Rental Ltd. 

Maguire 
Excavating 

Ltd. 

D. Hatfield 
Inc. 

Fundy 
Fencing Ltd. 

Galbraith 
Construction 

Ltd. 
 
Section 2:  Backhoes and Hydraulic Excavators, Loaders 
 

4 a) 1.3 cu. Yd. Backhoe/loader No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 120.00 

b) 1.3 cu. Yd. Backhoe/loader c/w breaker 
attachment (1000-1500 ft-lbs hammer) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 a) 
 

Track Type excavator (min 25 ton) c/w 
1.5 cu. yd. bucket No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 145.00 

   b) Float charge for above  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 175.00 

   c) 
Hydraulic breaker attachment for above 
crawler excavator (5000-6000 ft-lbs 
hammer)  

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 100.00 

6 a)* Track Type excavator (min 30 ton) c/w 
2 cu.yd. bucketl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 225.00 

   b) Float charge for above No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 175.00 

   c) 
Hydraulic breaker attachment for above 
crawler excavator (min 8000 ft-lbs 
hammer) 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 150.00 

7  
150 net hp, wheel loader c/w front plow 
and cutting edge  (for winter snow 
plowing) 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 177.50 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
Item 

 
Description 

Martin’s 
Crane Rental 

Ltd. 

Classic 
Construction 
(2012) Ltd. 

Ready Rentals 
Limited 

Larry’s 
Crane 

Rental Ltd. 

Maguire 
Excavating Ltd. 

D. 
Hatfield 

Inc. 

Fundy 
Fencing 

Ltd. 

Galbraith 
Construction 

Ltd. 
 
Section 3: Boom Trucks 
 
 
8  a) 

Boom truck 12.5-30 Ton capacity 
 (state length of boom without added 
extensions and capacity)  
 

99.00 No Bid No Bid 135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

    b) Boom truck 32-40 ton capacity 
(state length of boom without added 
extensions and capacity) 

119.00 No Bid No Bid 145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 
    c) 

Boom Truck 32-40 Ton (Min. 100ft 
reach) 
(for changing lights in ball fields) 

128.00 No Bid No Bid 145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 
Section 4: Floats, Heavy Trucks 
 
 
9 

Floats and trailers: 
Drop neck low bed float - 50 ton c/w 
tractor. 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 175.00 
 
10 

Heavy trucks – Within City Limits 
Hauling to Clarendon (flat rate per trip) 
Truck tractor c/w fifth wheel minimum 
g.v.w., 65,000 lb. (does not include 
trailer) 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
110.00 / hr 

525.00 / trip 

11 Truck tractor c/w dump trailer (min 25ft) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 135.00 
 
12 

 
Dump truck (tandem)   6 yd. Minimum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 
13 

 
Dump truck (tandem) 15 yd. Minimum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 105.00 

 
14 

 
5 tonne capacity trailer/float No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 150.00 

 
Section 5:  Snow Removal (will be awarded based on low bid to a Primary and Secondary Vendor) 
 
 
15 

Dump truck (tandem) 15 yd. Minimum  
winter snow removal – day and 
evening) 
 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 95.00 



 
 
15  
a) 

Dump truck (tandem) 24 yd. Minimum  
winter snow removal – day and 
evening) 
(Bidder must submit a list of minimum 5     
tandems)  

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 118.00 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Item 

 
Description 

Martin’s 
Crane Rental 

Ltd. 

Classic 
Construction 
(2012) Ltd. 

Ready Rentals 
Limited 

Larry’s 
Crane Rental 

Ltd. 

Maguire 
Excavating 

Ltd. 

D. Hatfield 
Inc. 

Fundy 
Fencing 

Ltd. 

Galbraith 
Construction 

Ltd. 
 
Section 6: Miscellaneous Equipment 
 
 
16 a) 

 
Post hole auger truck – 8” auger min                                           No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

      
b) 

 
Post hole auger truck – 12” auger min                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 
17 

 
Mobile steam truck  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 
 
 
 

 
Item  Description 

Ready Rentals Ltd. 

Rate less Operator 
 

          Daily                Wkly                 Mthly 
 
Section 7: Miscellaneous Equipment (please bid one or more rate options) 
 



 
18 

 
Plate compactor (24"x24") 48.00 192.00 576.00 

 
19 

 
Steel wheel double drum 
vibratory roller 2 ton (ride-on) 

170.00 680.00 2040.00 
 
20 

 
12” concrete saw -  hand held 60.00 140.00 720.00 

 
 
Note: The above amounts are recorded as opened.  The amounts have not been checked or verified and may contain errors. The City may waive minor non-compliance with mandatory 
requirements as set out in Section 120 of New Brunswick Regulation 2014-93 under the Procurement Act. 
 


